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de 12 – OK maybe you
don’t think of it as a

“special” episode, but this
one is a little bit different.

We have something
different to talk about. I’m
not really sure what it is,

but I’m sure it’s bad.
Anyways, we are going to
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be talking about the
special Valentine’s Day
episode of Best Week

Ever, so you’d better let
me know if you are

affected by the Valentine’s
Day sniffles or the sadness

of that combination of
candy and love.The effect
of bleaching on the bond
strength of two adhesives

to etched enamel.
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Bleaching agents can be
applied to the surface of

teeth to fade the
discolouration and remove
stains. However, bleaching

may affect the surface
morphology and

consequently the bond
strength of adhesives,

reducing the composite-to-
enamel bond strength. This
study evaluated the effect
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of bleaching on the bond
strength of self-etching

adhesives (G-Bond and the
F-Bond) to enamel

surfaces pre-treated with
9.5% polyacrylic acid.

Forty-eight human molars
were randomly divided

into four groups according
to the adhesives tested and

bleaching agent applied
(no bleaching, positive
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control; no bleaching,
negative control;

bleaching, positive control;
bleaching, negative

control). The negative
control groups received a
universal adhesive (Single
Bond) to be applied as the
adhesive bonding system.

The positive control
groups received a self-

etching adhesive (G-Bond)
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to be applied as the
adhesive bonding system.

After the bleaching
process, microshear bond
strength (μSBS) tests were

conducted. The four
groups were statistically
analysed by using a one-

way ANOVA and
Duncan's multiple range

test (α=0.05). No
significant differences (
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