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address. How can this happen? A: The DNS data
that is sent to the ELB is to the ELB, not to the
instances. The reason why it works from the

browser is because the browser sends an HTTP
request to the ELB and the ELB forwards the
request to the instance, passing the IP to the
instance. If you were to set up your own load
balancer, this wouldn't happen. The present
invention relates to an improved method for

maintaining an injected population of
subcutaneously implanted tissue in a state of
hyperplasia. More particularly, this invention

relates to a method for controlling the hyperplasia
of injected tissue cells, prior to the time of a

surgical procedure to be performed on the cells.
The advantage of the present method is that the
tissue cells that are of a size suitable for surgical
implantation are healthy, and at the same time

cells that are not suitable for surgical implantation
are destroyed prior to any surgical procedure.

Additionally, prior to surgical implantation there is
produced no tissue containing cells of undesirable

cellular size, structure or substance. The method of
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the present invention is especially useful where it
is desired to maintain high density cell populations

within tissue capsules that are implanted
subcutaneously, as, for example, in the case of
human or animal blood vessel replacement. The
present method ensures that the population of

cells that are available for surgical implantation are
present in a state of high density, therefore,

without requiring surgical implantation. This is
particularly advantageous where the implanted

tissue cell population is utilized for
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